
For semen and certificates, contact Tad Melton, Randall Spare or Mark Gardiner.

TAD MELTON
(804) 334-5810

RANDALL SPARE
(620) 635-2641

RICHIE LONGANECKER
  (813) 927-9090

MARK GARDINER
(620) 635-5095 

GAR

(+*18636059)

Today, we are able to select sires 
that excel for ALL of the traits of 
magnitude. Progressive registered 
and commercial beef producers 
can appreciate Quantum’s top 10% 
ranking for CED and yearling growth 
combined with top 3% marbling, top 
1% ribeye and $Beef. Quantum is 
one of only four bulls in the entire 
Angus non-parent bull population 
with this combination of excellence. 
Quantum’s elite Method Genetics 
top 1% ROI gives us great confidence 

in predicting the economic value of 
his calves, regardless of endpoint. 
This gentle sire has the added 
advantage of athleticism that allows 
him effortless movement to do his 
job. Finally, he is one of the most 
abundant semen producers we have 
seen. He consistently freezes large 
quantities of extremely high quality 
semen. Quantum is one of the most 
exciting sire prospects in the history 
of Gardiner Angus Ranch. 

	 EPD	 % Ranking
	 CED:	 +12	 10%
	 WW:	 +68	 10%
	 YW:	 +122	 10%
	 SC:	 +1.92	 3%
	 Doc:	 +29	 4%
	 CEM:	 +10	 35%
	 CW:	 +67	 2%
	Marb:	 +1.21	 3%
	 RE:	 +1.26	 1%
	 $B:	+197.88 	 1%

EPDs as of 1.2.19.

Method 
Genetics

	 MPI / %
	 +156 / 2%
	 QPI / %
	 +153 / 1%
	 ROI / %
	 +278 / 1%


